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The Royal Australian and New Zealand College of 
Psychiatrists (RANZCP) scholarly project (SP) is 
a mandatory component of psychiatry training 

in Australia and New Zealand, strengthening a culture 
of research and academic psychiatry.1 Aligning with 
the regional psychiatric zeitgeist, the SP focuses on the 
CanMEDS[AQ: 1] framework of research and the pro-
motion of evidence-based practice.1,2 Despite being a 
core component of training, trainees have reported diffi-
culties in completing this assessment, identifying lack of 
protected time for research, access to appropriate super-
vision and the numerous other college requirements as 
key factors in delaying SP completion.2

These difficulties are magnified in regional Australia, 
where there is a severe shortage of psychiatrists,3 further 
exacerbated by a lack of psychiatrists with experience in 
supervising trainees in completing the SP or with sig-
nificant academic psychiatric experience.1 Qualitative 
research has identified the struggles that rural trainees 
report in sourcing appropriate SP supervisors.1 Rural 
trainees report feeling disadvantaged due to limited peer 
contact, difficulty in accessing formal aspects of training 
and feeling educationally isolated.4 The experience and 
ease of completing the SP has been described as likely to 
be highly influenced by the supervision received.5

Whilst previous studies have described potential strate-
gies to overcome challenges in completing the SP,1,5 
there are few examples of how these have been success-
fully implemented by trainees. This report will describe 
a practical, real-life example of completing the RANZCP 
SP in a rural setting, with supervision and support pro-
vided by an academic psychiatrist working within a met-
ropolitan research centre.

Origins

The experience commenced pragmatically, following the 
trainee’s desire to explore research opportunities in psy-
chiatric rehabilitation. Working in a rural setting, access 
to an experienced supervisor with an interest in this area 
was limited. The trainee identified an expert supervisor 
with a strong interest in psychiatric rehabilitation during 
a formal education program, and fostered this relation-
ship through a meeting at the RANZCP congress. The 
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academic psychiatrist then proposed that they meet to 
explore SP possibilities.

Logistics

With the support of the regional employer, the trainee 
met with the potential supervisor to assess supervision 
opportunities and potential scholarly endeavours. Three 
well-defined projects, suitable for a SP, were identified that 
were aligned with the trainee’s interests and supervisor’s 
academic pursuits. With the supervisor’s support, the 
trainee explored the academic merit and suitability of 
each project. Having identified a project, the trainee and 
supervisor worked on a pragmatic memorandum of under-
standing regarding the trainee/supervisor arrangement, 
which was in turn supported by both the trainee’s and the 
metropolitan-employed supervisor’s organisations.

Supervision

Supervision was provided over an 18-month period 
across multiple modalities – combining both face-to-face, 
videoconferencing, telephone and email correspond-
ence. Freely available software-based videoconferencing 
solutions were utilised and reliable internet was available 
at both sites. The trainee and supervisor met regularly 
throughout the project. In line with previous guidance,5 
most aspects of the project could be completed without 
face-to-face supervision.

From the trainee’s perspective, the supervisor provided a 
caring attitude, delivering constructive feedback, keep-
ing the trainee accountable and ensuring achievable 
timelines.6 The supervisor guided the trainee through 
exploration of relevant literature, hypothesis refine-
ment, data collection and analysis as well as completing 
project write-up.6

Becoming part of a research community

Whilst rural trainees often report educational isolation, 
in this example the trainee became part of a team – inad-
vertently, becoming part of a research community. 
Through engagement in the project, the trainee was able 
to work within the supervisor’s research unit, drawing 
on the assistance and expertise of the unit’s research 
assistant as well as other academics. Through this col-
laboration, the trainee was able to access the Victorian 
Mental Health, Health Sciences Library, allowing access 
to the library’s extensive electronic database and 
resources.

Given the preliminary work previously undertaken to 
plan the project,7 the trainee collaborated with an inter-
national group of experts in psychiatric rehabilitation 
across the United Kingdom, Hong Kong, India and 
Australia. Without the networks already established by 

the supervisor, this scope and reach would clearly not 
have been possible.

Achievements: publication and 
presentation

Medical students and junior doctors are often concerned 
about completing rural training due to concerns around 
academic opportunity and career progression.8,9 High-
lighting achievements obtained in rural and regional 
placements is important in addressing these fears.

The supervisor and expert group7 were crucial in navi-
gating the project through the publication process, 
assisting the trainee to feel comfortable in completing a 
novel process.7

The supervisor and one of the international experts 
encouraged the trainee to apply for an award offered by 
the Royal College of Psychiatrists (RCPsych), UK. The 
project was judged to be of sufficient academic merit to 
be awarded the Douglas Bennett prize (RCPsych),10 
resulting in an opportunity for the trainee to present the 
project internationally (RCPsych)10 and later, locally, at 
the Section of Social, Cultural and Rehabilitation 
Psychiatry conference.11

Positive secondary outcomes

There were numerous positive secondary outcomes that 
were not anticipated when commencing the SP arrange-
ment.

As a result of presenting at the local Section conference 
and due to the expansion of the Section to include reha-
bilitation,11 the trainee was invited to – and accepted – a 
role within the Section as a co-opted committee member.

The trainee’s interest in rehabilitation psychiatry was 
enhanced, and ultimately, the trainee was able to dis-
seminate their learnings within their rural service. One 
prime example was the trainee’s ability to assist in the 
facilitation of a multifamily group for people with psy-
chosis – a first for the service.

From the trainee perspective, whilst not initially 
expected, but definitely greatly appreciated, was the 
guidance, support and mentorship the supervisor pro-
vided outside of the realm of the SP; helping the trainee 
to navigate RANZCP examinations, career progression 
and balancing work–life demands.

There were benefits for the supervisor, who was able to 
complete and publish a planned project in a timely fash-
ion, which had not progressed due to lack of available 
time and resources. The SP provided the supervisor with 
the satisfaction associated with mentoring and support-
ing a junior psychiatrist. Other supervisor benefits 
included: enhanced knowledge of rural training experi-
ences and the opportunity to build upon the trainee’s 
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enthusiasm and interest in rehabilitation to build capac-
ity within the RANZCP.

Barriers and challenges

Perhaps surprisingly, there were no major barriers identi-
fied in establishing supervision or in the SP completion.

Whilst it was hypothesised that having the trainee and 
the supervisor working in different organisations, large 
distances apart, could be a barrier, this was overcome 
and largely negated through the use of technology and 
the support of both the trainee and the supervisor’s 
employers; the trainee’s service was appreciative of the 
trainee’s exposure to, and supervision from, an expert in 
their area of interest, and the supervisor’s employer 
viewed the initiative as part of their core business in sup-
porting trainee academic endeavour. A key component 
was making this an enjoyable and mutually beneficial 
arrangement for all involved, ensuring a clear frame-
work around supervisor and trainee expectations, and 
assurance of accountability. Central to this occurring 
was having an experienced supervisor, as well as a trainee 
who was willing to take the initiative in seeking appro-
priate support and guidance.

Conclusion

This description is the first real-world example detailing 
how the challenges involved in completing the SP by a 
rural/regional trainee, including lack of access to appro-
priate supervision and educational isolation, can be 
overcome. This initiative demonstrates that it is possible 
to complete the SP as a rural trainee; it shows that the 
establishment of supervision arrangements for rural 
trainees with major research centres and academic psy-
chiatrists is achievable, with widespread benefits, such 
as becoming part of a research community. Whilst this 
example describes the experience of a rural trainee, it is 
not unreasonable that this model could also be applied 
to metropolitan trainees who don’t have access to appro-
priate supervisors within their workplace.

Support from both the trainee and the supervisor’s 
employers was crucial to guaranteeing the viability of 
this arrangement. A fundamental factor was ensuring 
that the project was mutually beneficial for all parties 
involved. Techniques, such as better access to, and use 
of, online resources such as video-conferencing and 
remote library access, should be evaluated in relation to 
successful completion of the scholarly project, as they 
have been in clinical applications.12

We hypothesise that this situation is not unique, that 
there are potentially numerous trainees wishing to com-
plete projects in their areas of interest without access to 
relevant academic expertise in their employing service. 
Equally, there are likely many academic psychiatrists 
with ready-made projects, looking for energetic and 
motivated trainees to undertake much needed work of 

academic merit.5 We question if trainees are aware of the 
possibility of seeking external supervision, or if they lack 
confidence that potential approaches for supervision 
will be well received? It is hoped that this description 
can not only abate any concerns these trainees may 
have, but also highlight the potential shared benefits of 
endeavours, such as those described.

Whilst the project required dedication and commitment 
from the trainee to achieve a desired outcome, the rela-
tive simplicity of processes involved to overcome previ-
ously described challenges should provide a sense of 
hope, confidence and motivation that successful com-
pletion of the SP is achievable. We recognise that this 
project relied on considerable goodwill, which may not 
be universally transferable. Future research should assess 
how translatable the approaches described are when 
applied to a range of services, supervisors and trainees.

Training and retaining a rural workforce is a significant 
concern for the RANZCP and medical community.3,9 
Future initiatives should look at ways of better connect-
ing and supporting trainees and supervisors with shared 
research interests, perhaps through establishing data-
bases of available supervisors and projects. Rural services 
should be proactive in supporting their trainees to com-
plete projects with local supervisors, should they be 
available, but they should also promote collaboration 
with research centres of excellence.
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